CHANDIGARH ADMINISTRATION
EXCISE & TAXATION DEPARTMENT

NOTIFICATION
31st March, 1999

No. 1925-UTFII(8)-99/3986:- In exercise of the powers conferred by Section 58 of the Punjab
Excise Act, 1914 (1 of 1914) and all other powers enabling him in this behalf, the
Administrator, Union Territory, Chandigarh is pleased to make the following rules further to
amend the Punjab Restaurant (Consumption of Liquor) Rules, 1955 as in force in the Union
Territory, Chandigarh, namely :-

1. These rules may be called the Punjab Restaurant (Consumption of Liquor)
(Chandigarh Amendment) Rules, 1999.

2. These rules shall come into force with effect from the 1st day of April, 1999.
3

In the Punjab Restaurant (Consumption of Liquor) Rules, 1955, for rule 5, the
following rule shall be substituted, namely :-

Liquor Shops under one roof Rs. 35,000
Separate L-2 vends Rs. 25,000
Country Liquor Rs. 20,000

No. 1924-UTFII(8)-99/3992:- In exercise of the powers conferred by Section 58 of the Punjab
Excise Act, 1914 (1 of 1914) and all other powers enabling him in this behalf, the
Administrator, Union Territory, Chandigarh, hereby makes the following rules further to amend
the Punjab Distillery Rules, 1932 as in force in the Union Territory, Chandigarh, namely :-

1. These rules may be called the Punjab Distillery (Chadnigarh Amendment) Rules,
1999.

These rules shall come into force with effect from the 1st day of April, 1999.

2.
3. In the Punjab Distillery Rules, 1932, in rule 93, for clause (J) (A), the following clause
shall be substituted, namely :-

(J) (A)  "Aregistration-cum-brand fee shall be leived on all types of liquor brands allowed to
be sold in the Union Territory, Chandigarh, on the following graduated scales :-

Rs. 40,000 per brand of Whisky/Scotch per annum.
Rs. 30,000 per brand of Rum/Gin per annum.

Rs. 40,000 per brand of Beer per annum.

Rs. 40,000 per brand of Wine per annum

oo

(By order in the name of the Administrator Union Territory, Chandigarh)

(Sd.) .o,
Finance Secretary and Secretary,
Excise and Taxation,



Chandigarh Administration.

EXCISE AND TAXATION DEPARTMENT
Notification

31st March, 1999

No. 1927-UTFII(8)-99/3980:- In exercise of the powers conferred by Section 59 of the Punjab
Excise Act, 1914 (1 of 1914) and all other powers enabling me in this behalf, | Anuradha
Gupta, Finance Secretary, Chandigarh Administration, exercising the powers of the Financial
Commissioner, Union Territiry, Chandigarh, am pleased to make the following rules further to
amend the Punjab Liquor Licence Rules, 1956 as in force in the Union Territory, Chandigarh,
namely:-

1. These rules may be called the Punjab Liquor Licence (Chandigarh Amendment)
Rules, 1999.

2. These rules shall come into force with effect from the 1st day of April, 1999.

3. In the Punjab Liquor Licence Rules, 1956 (hereinafter called the rules), in rule 36, in
sub-rule (25), for clause (ii), the following clause shall be substituted, namely :-
"(ii) The basic quota of country liquor is fixed as 18.5 lacs proof litre. The licensee is
entitled to lift his 70% of the basic quota in the shape of IMFL 60 degree and the
remaining 30% quota in the shape of country liquor 50 degree. The country liquor
licensee shall also be entitled to lift a supplementary quota of Rum, Gin and Whisky of
50 degree strength to the extent of 15% of the basic quota fixed for his vend at
various levels of incidence of licence fee. If the incidence exceeds Rs. 75 per bottle,
the successful bidder will be entitled to lift 5% of the basic quota and if the incidence
exceeds Rs. 85 per bottle another slab of 10% of the basic quota will be allowed to
convert 10% of the basic quota will be given to the licensee. However, the quota will
be made available to the licensee(s) on an additional duty @ Rs. 1 per proof litre over
and above the basic excise duty to convert 10% of their quota either way i.e. from 50
degree to 60 degree or vice-versa. The facility of supplementary quota shall be given
only when the potable spirit is available in the Union Territory, Chandigarh.

The licensee is allowed to lift IMFL economy brands in lieu of 15% (supplementary quota) of
the basic quota after paying an excise duty of Rs. 10 per proof litre. However, the converted
guota may be allowed to be lifted every month on proportionate basis of total converted quota
to which a licensee is entitled.

In case of an exigency arising during the year (1999-2000) an incentive quota (15% of the
basic quota) be allowed to lifted at an enhanced rate of excise duty i.e. @ Rs. 3 per proof litre.
The incentive quota may not be treated as a right by the licensee and shall be allowed only
when potable spirit is available in the Union Territory, Chandigarh.

4, Inthe said rules, in rule 25, in clause (V), for the words and figures "Rs. 30,000", the
words and figures "Rs. 50,000" shall be substituted.

5. Inthe said rules, in rule 37, in sub-rule (28), for clause (vi), the following clause shall
be substituted, namely :-
"(VI) The licensee shall not IMFL spirit at the rates below and minimum price fixed
by the Excise Commissioner from time to time for different brands of IMFL spirit as



detailed below:-

Quart Pint Nip
Economy brand Rs. 100 Rs. 52 Rs. 28
Medium brand Rs. 120 Rs. 62 Rs. 33
Premium brand Rs. 170 Rs. 90 Rs. 50
Deluxe brand Rs. 250 Rs. 130 Rs. 75"

6. In the said rules, in rule 37, in sub-rule (28) in clause (b) (ii) for (a) & (b) the following
shall be substituted, namely :-
However, the minimum sale price of draught beer sgall be as under :-

(a) Beer containing alcoholic contents not exceeding 5.25% Rs. 15 per mug
(b) Beer containing alcoholic contents not exceeding 8.25% Rs. 15 per mug

7. In the said rules, in rule 25, in clause (i) (b) for the words and figures "Rs. 15,000" the
words and figures "Rs. 10,000", shallbe substituted.
8. Inthe said rules, in rule 25, for clause (xiii), the following clause shall be substituted,

namely :-
"(xiii) Clubs having members upto 500 Rs. 50,000 per annum
Clubs having members upto 501-2000 Rs. 1,50,000 per annum

Clubs having members upto 2000 and above Rs. 2,50,000 per annum

9. In the said rules, in rule 31 under column "Spirit", Indian Made "Wine and Beer", for
the words figures "Rs. 90", "Rs. 22" and "Rs. 11" the words and figures "Rs. 100",
"Rs. 15" and "Rs. 15" shall be substituted.

No. 1926-UTFII(8)/99/3983 :- In exercise of the powers conferred by Section 59 of the Punjab
Excise Act, 1914 (1-1914) and all other powers enabling me in this behalf, I, Anuradha Gupta,
Finance Secretary, Chandigarh Administration exercising the powers of the Fnancial
Secretary, sioner, Union Territory, Chandigarh, hereby make the following rules further to
amend the Punjab Liquor Permit and Pass Rules, 1932 as inforce in the Union Territory
Chandigarh, namely :-

1. These rules may be called the Punjab Liquor Permit and Pass (Chandigarh
Amendment) Rules, 1999.

2. These rules shall come into force with effect from the 1st day of April, 1999.

3. In the Punjab Liquor Permit and Pass Rules, 1932 in rule 22, for clause (b), the
following clause shall be substituted, namely :-
"(b) A temporary permit shall be granted to L-4/ L-5/ L-12-C licensee to serve
IMFL/Beer at the Hotel/Conference hall or any other palce of Hotel on payment of Rs.
1000 per day per function subject to the condition that liquor to be served is
purchased from any of the L.2 (retail) vends of Chandigarh. In the case of
unlicensed/private banquet/Conference halls the licence fee shall be Rs. 3000 per day
per function.

Terms of the licence shall however remain the same."



No. 1928-UTFII(8)-99/3989 :- In exercise of the powers conferred by Sections 31, 32 and 59
of the Punjab Excise Act, 1914 (1 of 1914) and all other powers enabling me in this behalf, I,
Anuradha Gupta, Finance Secretary, Chandigarh Adminiatration, exercising the powers of the
Financial Commissioner, Union Territory, Chandigarh, am pleased to make the following
orders further to amend the Punjab Excise Fiscal Orders, 1932 as in force in the Union
Territory, Chandigarh, namely :-

1. These orders may be called the Punjab Excise Fiscal (Chadnigarh Amendemnt)
Orders, 1999.

2. These orders shall come into force with effect from the 1st day of April, 1999.

3. In the Punjab Excise Fiscal Orders, 1932 (hereinafter reffered to as the said Orders)
in order No. 1 in the table against Item No. (1) for the figure "1" the figure "2" shall be
substituted.

4, Inthe said orders, in order No. 1 in the table against Item No. (3), the following shalll
be substituted, namely :-

Economy brands
Medium brands
Premium brands
Deluxe brands

Rs. 24 per proof litre

Imported Liquor Rs. 45 per proof litre

5. In the said orders for under No. 2, the following shall be substituted, namely :-
"'2'  The rate of duty on all sweets and wines containing proof spirit of any strength
shall be charged @ Rs. 3 per buld litre."

6. In the said orders, in order No. 1 in the table after item No. 4, the following shall be
substituted, namely :-
"The duty on denatured spirit shall be Rs. 2 per bulk litre".

7. In the said order, for order No. 5, the following shall be substituted, namely :-

"(a) Beer containing alcoholic contents bot exceeding Rs. 2.50 per bottle
5.25%
(b) Beer containing alcoholic contents bot exceeding Rs. 5 per bottle
8.25%
(c) Beer containing alcoholic contents bot exceeding Rs. 3.50 per bulk litre
5.25%
(d) Beer containing alcoholic contents bot exceeding Rs. 8.50 per bulk litre
8.25%
(Sd)..........

Financial Commissioner,
Chandigarh Administration.



